
Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

SBS
SBR 2.44$         527,040.00$     2.37$         511,920.00$  2.350$           507,600.00$  

SS-1H 1.62$         87,480.00$       1.57$             84,780.00$    
SS-1VHF 1.57$             84,780.00$    

QF-40 1.63$         88,020.00$       
NTEA 1.66$         89,640.00$       

Demurrage 1                   150.00$     150.00$            100.00$     100.00$         100.00$         100.00$         

Description Qty
Unit Price / 

Ton
Delivery / 

Ton
Total

Unit Price / 
Ton

Delivery / Ton Total

Location 1 - Laybourne 
Road

4,000 28.35$          5.50$         135,400.00$     29.70$       15.50$           180,800.00$  

FOB at Plant 
Per Ton

Delivered / Ton
4075 Laybourne Rd

Springfield, Ohio

FOB at Plant 
Per Ton

Delivered / Ton
4075 Laybourne Rd

Springfield, Ohio

No. 2 $18.20 $23.70 $18.45 $33.95

Plant
Cedarville 

Quarry
Plant #311

No. 57 $25.05 $30.55 $21.45 $36.95

Plant
Cedarville 

Quarry
Plant #311

No. 67
Plant

No. 8 $28.35 $33.85 $29.70 $45.20

Plant
Cedarville 

Quarry
Plant #311

No. 9 $18.70 $34.20
Plant Plant #311

No. 304 $17.85 $23.35 $13.20 $28.70

Plant
Cedarville 

Quarry
Plant #311

No. 411 $20.00 $25.50 $14.85 $30.35

Plant
Cedarville 

Quarry
Plant #311

No. 617 $14.85 $30.35
Plant Plant #311

RCP Type A $30.80 $41.30

Plant
Cedarville 

Quarry

RCP Type B $30.80 $41.30

Plant
Cedarville 

Quarry

RCP Type C $28.65 $39.15 $41.25 $58.75

Plant
Cedarville 

Quarry
Plant #311

RCP Type D $28.65 $39.15 $39.05 $56.55

Plant
Cedarville 

Quarry
Plant #311

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Aggregate
Martin Marietta

Bids Opened:  Thursday, February 29, 2024

The Shelly Company

Aggregate No. 8 Martin Marietta

Fog Seal 54,000          

The Shelly Company

2024 Unit Prices

HFRS2-P 216,000        

Asphalt Emulsion
Description

Clark County Engineer's Office.  4075 Laybourne Road, Springfield, Ohio  45505

Terry Asphalt Materials, Inc.Marathon Asphalt Materials, Inc.


